REGULAR MEETING OF THE WEST BRANCH CITY COUNCIL HELD IN THE COUNCIL CHAMBER OF CITY HALL, 121 NORTH FOURTH STREET, MONDAY, FEBRUARY 6, 2006

Mayor Todd Thompson called the meeting to order at 7:00 p.m.

Present:  Mayor Todd Thompson, Council Members Gregory Clark, William Ehinger, Kim Ervans, Paul Frechette, Russell Jackson, Chad Lucas

Absent:  None

Other officers present:  City Manager William Gascoigne, Clerk/Treasurer Jane Tennant, Police Chief Rodger Williams, Housing Director Stacy Alley, and Attorney Michael Juarez

All stood for the Pledge of Allegiance.

MOTION BY CLARK, SECOND BY LUCAS, TO APPROVE THE MINUTES AND SUMMARY OF THE REGULAR MEETING HELD JANUARY 23, 2006.

Yes – Clark, Ehinger, Ervans, Frechette, Jackson, Lucas, Thompson

No – None

Motion carried

*  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *

MOTION BY JACKSON, SECOND BY FRECHETTE, TO RECEIVE AND FILE THE MINUTES OF THE PLANNING COMMISSION MEETING HELD JANUARY 10, 2006, THE 2005 ANNUAL POLICE REPORT, AND THE JANUARY POLICE REPORT.

Ye s- Clark, Ehinger, Ervans, Frechette, Jackson, Lucas, Thompson

No – None

Motion carried

*  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *

Mayor Thompson opened the public hearing on the Neighborhood Preservation Grant at 7:05 p.m.  Housing Director Alley provided Council with the following information:

1. Need for proposed activities were identified based on income, housing conditions, street and sidewalk improvements and downtown façade renovations.

2. Proposed Activities:

Homeowner Rehabilitation (11) – Grant $97,845, Leveraged Funds $24,462

Rental Rehabilitation (12) – Grant $150,000, Leveraged Funds $37,500

Demolition - $15,000

Public Improvements – Grant $85,000, Leveraged Funds $355,330

Beautification – Grant $50,000, Leveraged Funds $592,000

Homebuyer Assistance - $102,155

3. Proposed date that application will be submitted is February 10, 2006

4. Total amount of application is $500,000

5. Estimated portion of funds that will benefit low and moderate-income families are $247,845.

6. The proposed activities will be done north of Houghton Avenue, east of North Fifth Street, west of North Burgess Street and south of Lindsey Street.

7. There will be no displacement to homeowners or businesses from the results of funded activities.

8. Plans are in place in an event of displacement for funds to be available for rent and utility bills.

9. Purpose of the proposed activities are to provide low interest loans for home/rental improvements for existing homes that would create a higher tax base that will revolve back into the community.  The public improvements and beautification will provide sidewalk and road improvements, tree planting, façade improvements, school landscaping, demolition of abandoned structures and buying, rehabbing and reselling homes.

10. Application has been completed.

11. There have been no expenditures for this project to date.

12. The scope of the project is on schedule.  Expected starting date is May 2006.

Ms. Alley noted that the State has approved the proposed area.  Sarah Colclasure, Ogemaw County Herald, asked for clarification on a point.  No one else wished to be heard on this subject.

MOTION BY THOMPSON, SECOND BY LUCAS, TO CLOSE THE PUBLIC HEARING AT 7:08 P.M.

Yes – Clark, Ehinger, Ervans, Frechette, Jackson, Lucas, Thompson

No – None

Motion carried

MOTION BY THOMPSON, SECOND BY CLARK, TO ADOPT THE FOLLOWING RESOLUTION:

RESOLUTION #06-02


WHEREAS, the City of West Branch is interested in the continuing effort to upgrade housing conditions for its low and very low income homeowners;


WHEREAS, said West Branch City Council has reviewed and understands the Housing Resource Application;


WHEREAS, said West Branch City Council accepts the recommendation of the West Branch Housing Department to apply for $500,000;


WHEREAS, said West Branch City Council authorizes the Chief Elected Official to sign the application form as required;


THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the West Branch City Council authorizes the West Branch Housing Department to prepare and submit the application for funding through Michigan State Housing Development Authority’s Housing Resource Fund.

Yes – Clark, Ehinger, Ervans, Frechette, Jackson, Lucas, Thompson

No – None

Motion carried

*  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *

Brad Jenson, Huron Pines representative, was present to give the Council an update on the storm water project.  He stated that a study was conducted of our area (West Branch Township, Ogemaw Township, and the City of West Branch) on how storm water run off affects our rivers and how pollution problems can be eliminated.  He reviewed the funding sources that were used to pay for the study.  He noted that now the study is done the next stage would be implementation.  Larry Fox, Capital Consultants, reviewed the results of the study and the recommendations to solve the problems.

*  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *

MOTION BY LUCAS, SECOND BY CLARK, TO APPROVE THE BILLS IN THE AMOUNT OF $32,616.60.

Yes – Clark, Ehinger, Ervans, Frechette, Jackson, Lucas, Thompson

No – None

Motion carried

*  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *

MOTION BY JACKSON, SECOND BY FRECHETTE, TO ADOPT THE FOLLOWING RESOLUTION:

RESOLUTION #06-01


THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the West Branch City Council hereby authorizes the transferring of 25% of the Act 51 money from Major Street to Local Street.

Yes – Clark, Ehinger, Ervans, Frechette, Jackson, Lucas, Thompson

No – None

Motion carried

*  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *

MOTION BY CLARK, SECOND BY FRECHETTE, TO APPROVE THE BANNER REQUEST FROM THE OGEMAW RELAY FOR LIFE FOR JULY 17, 2006 THROUGH JULY 24, 2006.

Yes – Clark, Ehinger, Ervans, Frechette, Jackson, Lucas, Thompson

No – None

Motion carried

*  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *

MOTION BY CLARK, SECOND BY LUCAS, TO APPROVE THE BANNER REQUEST FROM THE WEST BRANCH AREA RETAIL MERCHANTS FOR JUNE 28, 2006 THROUGH JULY 5, 2006.

Yes – Clark, Ehinger, Ervans, Frechette, Jackson, Lucas, Thompson

No – None

Motion carried

*  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *

MOTION BY FRECHETTE, SECOND BY CLARK, TO APPROVE THE PEDDLERS AND SOLICITORS APPLICATION FROM BROTHER MICHAEL W. WHITMAN, COORDINATOR OF ST. JOSEPH YOUTH MINISTRY, TO COLLECT CANNED GOODS WITH HIS GROUP ON FEBRUARY 18, 2006 FROM 12 NOON UNTIL 2:00 P.M.

Yes – Clark, Ehinger, Ervans, Frechette, Jackson, Lucas, Thompson

No – None

Motion carried

*  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *

Manager Gascoigne reviewed the history of the engineering services agreement for the Wastewater Treatment Facility Analysis.  

MOTION BY THOMPSON, SECOND BY CLARK, TO PARTICIPATE IN THE ENGINEERING SERVICES AGREEMENT FOR THE WASTEWATER TREATMENT FACILITY ANALYSIS WITH WEST BRANCH TOWNSHIP AND OGEMAW TOWNSHIP WITH THE CITY’S PORTION NOT TO EXCEED $2,500.

Yes – Clark, Ehinger, Ervans, Frechette, Jackson, Lucas, Thompson

No – None

Motion carried

*  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *

Council reviewed the bids on the police car as follows:

1.  Dean Arbour Ford, West Branch, MI
2006 Ford Crown Vic V-8

$20,873.00

2.  Fernelius Chevrolet, Rose City, MI
2006 Chevrolet Impala V-6
$17,990.00

3.  Team Hodges, West Branch, MI

2006 Impala V-6


$20,888.04

4.  Team Hodges, West Branch, MI

2006 Dodge Charger V-6

$24,212.44

Discussion followed on what car would best fit the needs of the Police Department.

MOTION BY JACKSON, SECOND BY EHINGER, TO ACCEPT THE BID FROM FERNELIUS CHEVROLET IN THE AMOUNT OF $17,990.00 AS RECOMMENDED BY CHIEF WILLIAMS.

Yes – Clark, Ehinger, Ervans, Frechette, Jackson, Lucas, Thompson

No – None

Motion carried

*  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *

Council reviewed the bids on the grit chain as follows:

1.  Motion Industries Inc., Alpena, Michigan



Chain $29.87/ft









Links $45.81/ea









Straight pin – no bid









Locknuts – no bid









Bolts – no bid









Wear shoes – no bid

2.  Edwards Industrial Sales, Inc., Lansing, Michigan


$3,801.00 bid as a package

3.  Hitachi Maxco, Ltd., Kennesaw, Georgia



Chain $10.95/ft









Links $8.96/ea









Straight pins $3.98/ea









Locknuts – no bid









Bolts – no bid









Wear shoes – no bid

4.  DP Brown, Saginaw, Michigan




Chain - $17.55/ft









Links - $61.00/ea









Straight pins - $8.00/ea









Locknuts - $.28/ea









Bolts - $.65/ea









Wear shoes - $37.55/ea

Discussion followed on whether this was an all-inclusive bid or whether just certain items could be accepted.

MOTION BY THOMPSON, SECOND BY CLARK, TO AWARD THE BID AS FOLLOWS:  HITACHI MAXCO – 152 FEET OF CHAIN AT $10.95 PER FOOT AND 18 STRAIGHT PINS AT $3.98 PER PIN.

Yes – Clark, Ehinger, Ervans, Jackson, Lucas, Thompson

No – Frechette

Motion carried

*  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *  *

MOTION BY FRECHETTE, SECOND BY CLARK, TO ADJOURN AT 8:00 P.M.

_______________________________________

Todd Thompson, Mayor

______________________________________

Jane Tennant, Clerk

Approved:  February 20, 2006

